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Bonding
From : John Page <jpage@suretyl.com> Fri, Aug 29, 2014 12:13 PM
Subject : Bonding 74 attachments

To : lairdrussell@comcast.net
Cc : 'Susan' <susan@surety1.com>, 'Ryan Tash® <ryan@suretyl.com>

Russ, as we discussed, you have been approved for bonding up to $350k with Liberty Mutual. They are
one of the largest surety companies in the U.S., congratulations.

There is no fee for bid bonds and performance and payment bonds will cost 3% of the contract amount.
When submitting bid requests, please try to give adequate lead time to get approval from the surety.
(the $300k bid bond on the 11th has been approved). | am just filling in for Ryan so future bid bond
requests should be sent to susuan@surety1.com and ryan@suretyl.com. A bid bond request form is
also attached for your future reference.

Attached is the application you completed and we have added an indemnity agreement on Page 4. You
need to sign the agreement twice on the lines over your name and your spouse also needs to sign. Please
date the agreement as well. Fax or e-mail it back and we will issue the bid bond.

Welcome to the Surety1!

John T. Page, President

Suretyl | 3225 Monier Circle Suite 100, Rancho Cordova, CA 95742
Direct Line: 916 737 5729 Fax: 916 737 5737 E-mail: jpage@suretyl.com
Website: www.suretyl.com | Blog: www.surety1.com/blo
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CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE; This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended
recipient's and may contain confidential and privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or
distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy
all copies of the original message.
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